NG A BETe, Document Record For:

‘*"?)ﬁﬁﬁﬁ S&P Project #:

Time:
Stevenson ¢ Palmer oot |
Engineering, Inc :

et # e / Addre Phone

City of Dacula

Dacula Streetscpape Improvements

S336-05-01 Owner:

City of Dacula

2:00 PM Bid Date:

February 24, 2010

$75 Location:

442 Harbins Rd

$400,000

Dacula, GA 30019

442 Harbins Rd, Dacula, Georgia 30019

NIA IPhone: (770) 963-7451

1/25/2010

Fax: (770) 513-2187

N/A

Adde

-

2/19/2010

Dodge Plan Room

N/A 1750 Enterprise Way Ste 103 Marietta, GA 30067

Phone: (404) 255-2565

1/26/2010

Fax: (404) 255-5316

N/A

Dodge Plan Room

N/A 1281 Broad St. Augusta, GA 30901-115

1/26/2010

Phone: 706-733-9990

Fax: 706-733-9992

N/A

Precision 2000 Inc.

2215 Lawson Way, Atlanta, Ga 30341

Phone: (770) 455-6142 ext 207

1/26/2010

Fax: (770) 455-6120

$75.00

$428,789.20

North American Pipeline Management, Inc.

4779 South Atlanta Rd., Ste 350, Smyrna, GA 30080

1/27/2010

Phone: (770) 318-5075

Fax: (678) 820-3993

$75.00

no bid

Artistic Concrete of Georgia

3001 Monroe Hwy Ste 300A, Watkinsville, Ga 30577

Phone: 770-725-8140

1/28/2010

Fax: 770-725-8145

$75.00

$301,179.22

C.W. Matthews Contracting Co., Inc.

1600 Kenview Drive, Marietta, GA 30061

Phone: 770-422-7520

1/29/2010

Fax: 770-422-9361

$75.00

no bid

1S C, Inc.

2251 Plunkett Road Northwest, Conyers, GA 30012

Phone: 770-929-8390

1/29/2010

Fax: 770-761-6332

$75.00

no bid

Strickland & Sons Pipeline, Inc.

1551 Fulenwider Road, Gainesville, GA 30507

2/2/2010

Phone: 770-535-2246

Fax: 535-2248

$75.00

$393,056.50

Zaveri Enterprises, Inc.

2184 Sugar Springs Drive, Lawrenceville, GA 30043

Phone: 770-513-1397

2/3/2010

Fax: 770-682-0050

$75.00

$272,650.84

Baldwin Paving Company

1014 Kenmill Drive N.W. Marrietta, GA 30060

2/4/2010

Phone: (770) 425-9191

Fax; (770) 425-0790

$75.00

no bid

Georgia Development Partners, LLC

300 Galleria Parkway Ste 1600, Atlanta, GA 30339

Phone: (770) 683-9870

2/5/2010

Fax: (770) 955-2742

$75.00

no bid

GS Construction, Inc.

526 Lyle Circle, Lawrenceville, GA 30045

10 Phone: 678-377-8028

2/5/2010

Fax: 678-377-8035

$75.00

$324,389.64

The Dickerson Group, Inc.

11 871 Old Peachtree Road, NW, Lawrenceville, GA 30043

Phone: 770-513-4558

2/8/2010

Fax: 770-513-4740

$75.00

$209,558.05

JHC Corporation

12 1029 Peachtree Pkwy, # 359, Peachtree City, GA 30269

2/8/2010

Phone: 770-487-3258

Fax: 770-487-4254

$75.00

$382,716.50

Reliant Construction, Inc.

1005 B. Union Center Drive, Alpharetta, GA 30004

13 Phone: 770-887-3961

2/8/2010

Fax: 770-887-6560

$75.00

$376,664.86

Woodwind Construction

14 5150 Buford Hwy Ste 1 Norcross, GA 30071

2/10/2010

Phone: 770-449-3250

Fax: 770-449-3297

$75.00

$283,460.00

CMC, Inc.

15 46 Old Peachtree Rd Suwanee, GA 30024

Phone: 770-614-0348

2/10/2010

Fax: 678-714-0040

$75.00

no bid




NG A BE e Document Record For:

Dacula Streetscpape Improvements

_;"Zfﬁﬁ\%ﬂ S&P Project #: $336-05-01 Owner:  City of Dacula
R Y Time: 2:00 PM Bid Date: February 24, 2010
Stevenson& Pa]rner Deposit: $75 Location: 442 Harbins Rd
E‘Jm-lmg Inc Estimated Cost: $400,000 Dacula, GA 30019
- e 1)
Deposit .
Set # Name / Address / Phone / Fax Date Issued ) Bid Amount
Received
Athena Construction Group, Inc.
1620 Vesta Ave., College Park, GA 30337 X
16 Phone. 404-768.7803 2/10/2010 $75.00 no bid
Fax: 404-768-7975
Blount & Sons Concrete
P.0O. Box 2002, Moultrie, GA 31776 .
17 Phone: 229-985-7872 2/11/2010 $75.00 no bid
Fax: 229-985-6802
Matriarch Construction Co., Inc.
100 Lloyd Ave., Suite C, Tyrone, GA 30290
18 Phone: 770-486-6573 2/12/2010 $75.00 $301,383.00
Fax: 770-486-9043
Tri Scapes, Inc.
1595 Peachtree Parkway, Ste 204-396, Cumming, GA, 30041
19 Phone. 770-752-4698 2/15/2010 $75.00 $380,274.75
Fax: 770-752-6792
Southern Pipeline, Inc.
210 Falling Leaf Trail, Cornelia, GA 30531 X
20 Phone 770-402-2855 2/18/2010 $75.00 no bid
Fax: (706)778-4224
Johnson Landscapes, Inc.
21 [B025 Matt Highway Cumming, GA 30028 2/19/2010 $75.00 $318,978.50

Phone: 770-888-2224

Fax: 404-861-3426




