Steve

Set #

N/A

Document Record For: Walking and Cycling Trails

Owner:

Bid Date:

Location:

SN S&P Project #: $321-06-01
s AL Time: 11:00 AM
L &Palmer Deposit: $150 Plans
gineering, Inc. Estimated Cost: $780,000.00

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

City of Locust Grove

3644 Highway 42 South

Phone: (770) 957-5043

Fax: (770) 954-1223

Date

City of Locust Grove

April 1, 2010

ADDENDUM

3644 Highway 42 South

3/29/2010

Locust Grove, GA 30248

Amount

N/A

Base Bid

Date of
Addendum

N/A

Dodge Plan Room

1750 Enterprise Way Ste 103, Marietta, GA 30067

Phone: (770) 953-2442

Fax. (770) 953-2430

N/A

N/A

Dodge Plan Room

1281 Broad Street, Augusta, GA 30339

Phone: (706) 733-9990

Fax: (706) 733-9992

N/A

N/A

AGC Builder's Exchange

1940 The Exchange, Suite 300, Marietta, GA 30339

Phone: (678) 298-4128

Fax. (678) 298-4131

N/A

N/A

Reed Construction Data

30 Technology Parkway S, Suite 100, Norcross, GA 30092

Phone: (770) 417-4000

Fax. (770) 417-4002

N/A

N/A

Stevenson & Palmer Engineering Inc

2430 Herodian Way Ste 101, Smyrna, GA 30080

Phone: (770) 952-2481

Fax. (770) 955-1064

N/A

ISC, Inc.

2251 Plunkett Road Northwest, Conyers, GA 30012

Phone: |(770) 922-2705

Fax. _ |(770) 761-6332

3/5/2010

$150.00

$545,000.00

Artistic Concrete (Joey Hall)

PO Box 7221, Athens, GA 30604

Phone: |(770) 725-8140

Fax (770) 725-8145

email: jhall_artistic@bellsouth.net/artistil@bellsouth.net

3/8/2010

$150.00

no bid

B & J Paving, Inc.

4185 Rooservelt Hwy College Park, GA 30349

Phone: |(404) 761-8891

Fax.__ |(404) 761-8892

email: dmcclain@bandjcontracting.com

3/8/2010

$150.00

no bid

Blount & Sons Concrete Finishing Service, Inc.

401 2nd St. NE Moultrie, GA 31776

Phone: [(229) 985-7872

Fax. _ |(229) 985-6802

email: acblountsr@yahoo.com

3/10/2010

$150.00

$442,270.00

Glosson Enterprises. LLC

4671 South Main St. Acworth GA 30101

Phone: |(770) 975-8000

Fax.__|(770) 975-0020

3/10/2010

$150.00

$389,120.00

Lambert Sand & Gravel Co.,Inc.

134 Atlanta St. McDonough, GA 30253

Phone: [(770) 957-8511

Fax: 770) 957-0972

email btanner9@bellsouth.net

3/10/2010

$150.00

no bid

Tri Scapes, Inc

380 Mullinax Rd Alpharetta 30004

Phone: |(770) 752-0846

Fax. _ |(770) 752-6792

3/15/2010

$150.00

$414,200.00

Franklin & Rowe Contractors LLC

3395 Jonesboro Rd SE Suite A Atlanta, GA 30354

Phone: _(404) 551-4482

Fax. _ (770) 716-5596

3/4/2010

$150.00

no bid

Matriarch Construction, Co.,Inc.

100 Lloyd Ave. Suite C Tyrone, GA 30290

Phone: (770) 486-6573

Fax. __ (770) 486-9043

$40,260.00

$150.00

no bid

10

Zaveri Enterprises, Inc.

2184 Sugar Springs Drive, Lawrenceville, GA 30043

Phone: _ (770)519-1397

Fax. __ (770) 682-0050

3/22/2010

$150.00

no bid

11

Anderson CCBI & Quintessential Homes

P.O. Box 7524, Macon, GA 31209

Phone: _ (678)265-0809

Fax. _ (678)565-4449

3/22/2010

$150.00

no bid

12

Johnson Landscapes, Inc.

6025 Matt Highway Cumming, GA 30028

Phone: (770)888-2224

3/23/2010

$150.00

no bid
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Tople Construction and Engineering, Inc.
792 Donald Lee Hollowell Pkway NW, Atlanta, GA 30318 ’
13 Phone: (404) 847-1090 3/23/2010 $150.00 no bid
Fax: (404) 874-1095
Willow Construction
1582 Barrington View, Stone Mountain, GA 30087
14 Phone: (770)879-1687 3/23/2010 $448,800.00
Fax: (770) 879-1689
JHC Corporation
1029 Peachtree Pkwy N#359, Peachtree City, GA 30269
15 Phone: (770)487-3258 3/24/2010 $150.00 $661,000.00
Fax: (770)487-4254
Southeastern Site Development, Inc.
P.O. Box 72777 Newnan, GA 30271
16 oione (678)423.7770 3/25/2010 $150.00 $367,650.00
Fax: (678)423-7771
Baldwin Paving Co., Inc.
1014 Kenmill Drive, NW, Marietta, GA 30060
17 Phone: (770) 4259191 3/25/2010 $150.00 $547,794.50
Fax: (770) 425-0790
18
Phone:
Fax:
19
Phone:
Fax:
20
Phone:
Fax:
21
Phone:
Fax:
22
Phone:
Fax:
23
Phone:
Fax:
24
Phone:
Fax:
25
Phone:
Fax:
26
Phone:
Fax:
27
Phone:
Fax:




