(NG A BETE, Document Record For: Shenandoah WWTP Reuse Pump Station & Pipeline

Owner:

Bid Date: October 20, 2009

Location: 230 East Newnan Road

SN, S&P Project #: S207-09-80
Time: 2:00 PM
Stevenﬁon&Pahner Deposit: $100
Engineering, Inc. Estimated Cost: $500,000.00

N/A

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

Coweta County Water & Sewerage

230 East Newnan Road, Newnan, GA 30263

(770) 254-3710 Phone

(770) 683-6441 Fax

9/25/2009

Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority

ADDENDUM

10/15/2009

Newnan, GA 30263

Amount

N/A

N/A

Dodge Plan Room

1750 Enterprise Way Ste 103, Marietta, GA 30067

Phone: 770.953.2442

Fax: 770.953.2430

9/25/2009

N/A

N/A

Reed Construction Data

30 Technology Parkway Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092

Phone: 770.849.6434

Fax: 770.849.6472

9/25/2009

N/A

N/A

AGC Builder's Exchange

1940 The Exchange, Suite 300 Atlanta, GA 30339

Phone: 678.298.4128

Fax: 678.298.4131

9/25/2009

N/A

Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Inc. Contact: Lubin Kruse

3000 Smith Road, Fortson, GA 31808

Phone: 706.576.5228

Fax: 706.576.5227

9/25/2009

$100.00

Brent Scarbrough and Company, Inc.  Contact: Brian Gosdin

155 Robinson Drive, Fayetteville, GA 30214

Phone: 770.461.8303

Fax: 770.461.0470

9/29/2009

$100.00

Ronny D. Jones Enterprises, Inc. Contact: Carroll Liberatone

679 Hwy 29 S., Newnan, GA 30263

Phone: 770-251-2667

Fax:  770-254-1563

9/29/2009

$100.00

Strack, Inc. Contact: Joe Strack

125 Laser Industrial Court, Fairburn, GA 30213

Phone: 770-969-1591

Fax:  770-964-7889

9/29/2009

$100.00

Lanier Contracting Co. Contact: Dwight Dorsey

3690 Lawrenceville-Suwanee Road, Suwanee, GA 30024

Phone: 770-932-1800

Fax.  770-945-2481

10/1/2009

$100.00

Willow Construction, Inc.

3970 Flint Hill Road, Powder Springs, GA 30127

Phone: 770-222-1555

Fax: 770-222-9139

10/5/2009

$100.00

Crawford Grading & Pipeline, Inc.

1505 Dunlap P.O. Box 263 Luthersville, Ga 30251

Phone: 770-927-0413

Fax: 770-927-2533

10/5/2009

$100.00

Unity Construction Co., Inc.

3941 Flint Hill Rd, Powder Springs, GA 30127-2834

Phone: 770-943-9886

Fax: 770-943-9828

10/7/2009

$100.00

Don Hall Construction, Inc.

670 Hall Road, Hampton, GA 30228

Phone:  770-946-4953

Fax: 770-946-4626

10/13/2009

$100.00

10

Tritt Contracting , Inc.

295 Shelby Lane, Jasper, GA 30143

Phone:  706-253-1187

Fax: 706-253-1186

10/13/2009

$100.00

11

Duncan Pipeline, Inc.

100 Old Dawson Village Rd. Ste 120 Dawsonville, GA 30534

Phone:  678-410-7451

Fax: 706-216-9856

10/14/2009

$100.00

12

Mid-South Builders

7057 Maddox Rd, Lithonia, GA 30058

Phone: (770)484-9600

Fax: (770)484-8046

10/14/2009

$100.00

13

Coweta County Water & Sewerage

230 East Newnan Road, Newnan, GA 30263

Phone: (770) 254-3710 Phone

Fax: (770) 683-6441 Fax

10/15/2009

Date of

Addendum




WG ABET Document Record For: Shenandoah WWTP Reuse Pump Station & Pipeline ADDENDUM

§“;,;7//_ﬁ\i\:§% S&P Project #: S207-09-80 Owner:  Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority
Time: 2:00 PM Bid Date: October 20, 2009
Steven_son&Palmer Deposit: $100 Location: 230 East Newnan Road 10/15/2009
Engineering, Inc. Estimated Cost: $500,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Date of
Addendum

Name / Address / Phone / Fax Base Bid

Oakley and Ayers Contracting, LLC

58 Weldon Rd, Palmetto GA 30268

Phone:  (770)463-5770

Fax: (770)463-8979

Sol Construction, LLC

4120 Presidential Pkwy Ste 115, Atlanta, GA 30340
Phone: (770)455-1822

Fax; 800-996-0385

Vellano Bros Inc

1301 Cusseta Road Bldg B, Columbus, GA 31901
Phone; (706)322-6160

Fax: (706)322-3484

L&L Utilities, Inc.

746 Robert Webb Road, East Dublin, GA 31027
Phone:  (478) 274-0876

Fax: (478) 274-8211

Lantz Construction (Andrew Lantz)

239 Clifton Lane, Peachtree City, GA 30269
Phone: 678-787-1561

Fax; 770-632-1958

HD Supply Waterworks

3710-B Atlanta Industrial Parkway. Atlanta, GA 30331
Phone: (404) 691-0373

Fax: (404) 691-8018

Ferguson

280 First Manassas Mile Rd, Fayetteville, GA 30215
Phone: (770) 967-1845

Fax: (770) 967-2902

14 10/15/2009 $100.00

15 10/15/2009 $100.00

16 10/15/2009 $100.00

17 10/16/2009 $100.00

18 10/19/2009 $100.00

19 10/20/2009 $100.00

20




N
COWETA
COUNTY

WATER & SEWERAGE

A U T H O R I: “T Y

BIDS RECEIVED:

COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY

BID DATE: October 20, 2009
TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M.

Shenandoah WWTP Reuse Pump Station & Pipeline

ﬁma ABEr7g,

SN,
Stevenson&Pa]mer

Engineering, Inc.

DIVISION | DIVISION 11 DIVISION 11l DIVISION IV
BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2
LICENSE w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO BASE BID
BIDDER NUMBER | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) PuUmp Station
BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 (Lump Sum)
w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE
(Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only)
Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co.
1 | 3000 Smith Road NO BID
Fortson, GA 31808
Brent Scarbrough & Co, Inc.
2 | 155 Robinson Drive NO BID
Fayetteville, GA 30214
Ronny D. Jones Enterprises
3 | 679 Hwy 29 S. NO BID
Newnan, GA 30263
Strack, Inc. $82,580.49 $54,030.70 NO BID $167,086.74 $122,637.30 NO BID $5,675.23 $4,748.77 NO BID
4 | 125 Laser Industrial Court UC300084 NO BID
Fairburn, GA 30213 $91,386.59 $56,088.20 NO BID $180,044.44 $125,664.80 NO BID $5,899.93 $4,801.27 NO BID
Lanier Contracting Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 | 3690 Lawrenceville-Suwanee Rd | UC300168 $238,691.00
Suwanee, GA 30024 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willow Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 | 3970 Flint Hill Road UC300091 $240,000.00
Powder Springs, GA 30127 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crawford Grading & Pipeline $77,0130.18 $49,631.54 NO BID $160,033.34 $117,122.59 NO BID $5,924.60 $4,833.45 NO BID
7 | 1505 Dunlap/P.O. Box 263 UC300426 $322,999.80
Luthersville, GA 30251 $115,447.28 $61,894.54 NO BID $216,647.59 $135,227.04 NO BID $8,668.25 $6,909.30 NO BID
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X
COWETA
COUNTY

WATER & SEWERAGE

A U T H O R I: “T Y

BIDS RECEIVED:

COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY

BID DATE: October 20, 2009
TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M.

Shenandoah WWTP Reuse Pump Station & Pipeline

SN
Steven_son&Palmer

Engineering, Inc.

DIVISION | DIVISION 11 DIVISION Il DIVISION IV
BASE BID ALT 1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT 1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT 1 ALT 2
LICENSE w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO BASE BID
BIDDER NUMBER | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) PuUmp Station
BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT 1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT 1 ALT 2 (Lump Sum)
w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE
(Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only)
Unity Construction Co., Inc. $118,430.92 $83,232.92 $38,490.18 $244,856.86 $195,737.86 $61,569.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 | 3941 Flint Hill Rd UC300132 NO BID
Powder Springs, GA 30127 $161,844.17 $91,462.92 $78,158.77 $308,434.36 $207,847.86 $120,363.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Don Hall Construction, Inc. $111,768.50 $73,556.50 NO BID $220,796.80 $168,666.80 NO BID $14,210.00 $14,130.00 NO BID
9 | 670 Hall Road UC300111 NO BID
Hampton, GA 30228 $206,413.50 $155,856.50 NO BID $366,116.80 $289,766.80 NO BID $20,720.00 $19,380.00 NO BID
Tritt Contracting, Inc.
10 | 295 Shelby Lane NO BID
Jasper, GA 30143
Duncan Pipeline, Inc.
100 Old Dawson Village Rd
11 Ste 120 NO BID
Dawsonville, GA 30534
Mid-South Builders $78,429.25 $53,549.25 NO BID $176,524.25 $136,947.25 NO BID $11,108.00 $10,159.00 NO BID
12 | 7057 Maddox Rd UC300116 NO BID
Lithonia, GA 30058 $91,803.00 $60,956.25 NO BID $196,203.00 $147,846.25 NO BID $12,158.00 $11,062.00 NO BID
Coweta County WSA
13 | 230 East Newnan Rd OWNER
Newnan, GA 30263
Oakley & Ayers Contracting $124,294.88 $74,920.95 NO BID $267,722.59 $189,902.64 NO BID $14,326.86 $12,786.76 NO BID
14 | 58 Weldon Rd UC301689 $216,738.00
Palmetto GA 30268 $148,079.58 $79,241.70 NO BID $302,720.49 $196,260.39 NO BID $14,933.76 $12,897.01 NO BID
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N
COWETA
COUNTY

WATER & SEWERAGE

A U T H O R I: “T Y

BIDS RECEIVED:

COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY

BID DATE: October 20, 2009
TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M.

Shenandoah WWTP Reuse Pump Station & Pipeline

S

SHAUNN

GABET
WO D ey

2,
%

Stevenson&Pa]mer

Engineering, Inc.

DIVISION | DIVISION I DIVISION 111 DIVISION IV
BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2
LICENSE w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO w/PVCO BASE BID
BIDDER NUMBER | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) PuUmp Station
BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 BASE BID ALT1 ALT 2 (Lump Sum)
w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE w/HDPE
(Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only) | (Labor/Materials) | (Labor/Materials) | (Materials Only)
25'253?353223; IF;L_C NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 Ste 115 wy UC301642 $209,000.00
Atlanta. GA 30340 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vellano Bros, Inc. $27,864.00 $39,733.50 $1,907.00
16 | 1301 Cusseta Road Bldg B MA(‘)TI\IIE LR\I(AL
Columbus, GA 31901 $34,036.50 $48,816.00 $2,153.75
L&L Utilities, Inc.
17 | 746 Robert Webb Road NO BID
East Dublin, GA 31027
Lantz Construction $78,451.35 $55,244.10 NO BID $158,948.35 $116,852.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 | 239 Clifton Lane UC301154 NO BID
Peachtree City, GA 30269 $90,796.35 $53,186.60 NO BID $186,195.85 $113,825.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HD Supply Waterworks $22,091.00 $35,010.45 $757.15
19 | 3710-B Atlanta Industrial Pkwy. MAC‘)Tl\IIE E\I(AL
Atlanta, GA 30331 $52,212.80 $79,333.05 $1,525.75
Ferguson Waterworks $23,751.30 $36,098.75 $1,057.55
20 | 280 First Manassas Mile Rd MA(‘)TI\IIE LR\I(AL
Fayetteville, GA 30215 $29,018.50 $43,849.15 $1,191.95
Please Note: County’s
determination of Low Bidder is PVCO Low Bidder HDPE Low Bidder Pump Station Low Bidder Non-responsive bidder
based on Grand Totals of LEGEND:

Division I, 11 & I11.

Bid line items were multiplied incorrectly; however, this does not affect the determined low bidder for

project.
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