
S&P Project #: Owner:
Time: Bid Date:
Deposit: Location:
Estimated Cost:

Amount

Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority

670 Hall Road, Hampton, GA 30228
770-946-4953
770-946-4626

6/10/2009 $150.00

6/10/2009 $150.00

770-434-1009

8
Crawford Grading & Pipeline, Inc.

9
Don Hall Construction, Inc.

P.O. Box 263, Luthersville, GA 30251
770-927-0413
770-927-2533

6
K.M. Davis Contracting, Co. Inc.

6/10/2009 $150.00

6/10/2009

3259 Austell Rd SW Marietta, GA 300
770-434-0095

5
Lanier Contracting, Co.

6/9/20093690 Lawrenceville-Suwannee Road Suwanee, GA 30024
770-932-1800
770-945-2481

4
John R. Walker, Inc.

6/9/20094038-475 Industrial Blvd. Macon, GA 31210
478-474-8841
478-474-3197

$150.00

3
Willow Construction, Inc.

6/9/20093970 Flint Hill Road, Powder Springs, GA 30127
770-222-1555
770-222-9139

$150.00

6/9/2009125 Laser Industrial Ct, Fairburn, GA 30213
770-969-1591
770-964-7889

$150.00

N/A

Midsouth Builders

6/9/20097057 Maddox Road, Lithonia, GA 30058
770-484-9600
770-484-8046

$150.00

2430 Herodian Way Ste 101, Smyrna, Ga 30080
770-952-2481
770-955-1064

N/A
Dodge Plan Room
1281 Broad Street, Augusta, GA 30339
706-733-9990
706-733-9992

N/A
Reed Construction Data

6/9/200930 Technology Parkway S., Suite 100, Norcross, GA 30092
770-849-6434
770-849-6472

N/A

$150

N/A
Dodge Plan Room

6/9/2009

770-254-3714

N/A

Set #

770-254-3710
6/9/2009

Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority

Document Record For:

2:00 PM

Date

SR 34 Sewer System Extension-Phase I

July 7, 2009
230 East Newnan Road

S207-09-81

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

$1,000,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Base Bid

3

1

2

5

N/A

N/A

N/A230 East Newnan Road, Newnan, Ga 30263

N/A 6/9/20091940 The Exchange, Suite 300, Marietta, Ga 30339
678-298-4128
678-298-4131

1750 Enterprise Way Ste 103, Marietta, GA 30067
770-953-2442
770-953-2430
AGC Builder's Exchange

N/A

Stevenson & Palmer Engineering Inc

6/9/2009

N/A 6/9/2009

1

2

10
RTD Construction, Inc.

7
Ronny D. Jones Enterprises, Inc.
679 Hwy 29 Ste A Newnan, GA 30263
770-251-2667
770-254-1563

Strack Inc.

6/11/2009 $150.00P.O. Box 996, Zephyrhills, FL 33539-0996
813-783-9119
813-783-9333

D
at

e 
of

 A
dd

en
du

m 7/2/2009

7/2/2009

4

6

11
American Cast Iron Pipe Company  (Supplier)**

6/11/2009 $150.002916-16th Street, North, Birmingham, Alabama 35207
205-325-8022
800-442-2347

12
T.J. Lyle & Company, Inc.

6/15/2009 $150.001481 Old Alabama Road, Taylorsville, GA 30178
770-607-0164
770-607-0593

13
Greg (per Corkey/David Smith)

6/16/2009 $0.00

14
Tommy L. Griffin Plumbing & Heating, Co.

6/17/2009 $150.003743 Atlantic Ave, Macon, GA 31204
478-477-5171
478-471-8195



S&P Project #: Owner:
Time: Bid Date:
Deposit: Location:
Estimated Cost:

Amount

Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority

$150

Set #

Document Record For:

2:00 PM

Date

SR 34 Sewer System Extension-Phase I

July 7, 2009
230 East Newnan Road

S207-09-81

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

$1,000,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Base Bid

3450 Novis Pointe Nw, Acworth, GA 30101-6640
770-529-8883 
770-529-8923 

33
Hayes Pipe Supply, Inc.

7/6/2009 $150.00

239 Clifton Lane, Peachtree City, GA 30269
678-787-1561
770-632-1958

32
Lantz Construction, LC

7/2/2009

P.O. Box 594, Parrish, FL 34219
941-776-8580
941-723-8828

31
B&B Horizontal of Manatee, Inc.

7/2/2009

1705 Krug Street, Albany, GA 31705
229-436-1411
229-883-0382

30
POPCO, INC.

6/29/2009 $150.00

7561-A Industrial Court, Alpharetta, GA 30004
770-475-8199
770-475-8167

29
Steele & Associates, Inc.

6/26/2009 $150.00

5353 North Lake Dr. Lake City GA. 30260
404-366-8569
404-366-4202

28
Turpin Inc.

6/25/2009 $150.00

2558 Highway 145, Eastanollee, GA 30538
706-6294701
706-779-3124

624 A Hancock Industrial Way Athens, GA 30605
404-691-0373
404-691-8018

6/24/2009 $150.00

27
Ceder Farms & Construction, Inc

6/24/2009 $150.00

25
Vellano Bros, Inc.

26
HD Supply Waterworks 

6/24/2009 $150.00

58 Weldon Road, Palmetto, GA 30268
770-463-5770
770-463-8979

1301 Cussetta Rd Bldg B, Columbus, GA 31901
706-322-6160
706-322-3484

24
Oakley & Ayers Contracting, LLC

6/24/2009 $150.00

300 Churchhill Court, Woodstock, GA 30188
770-992-9300
678-494-3601

23
Astra Grading & Pipe, LLC 

6/24/2009 $150.00

1915 James Jackson Parkway, Atlanta, GA 30318
404-792-1941
404-792-9975

22
D & H Construction Company 

6/23/2009 $150.00

15
Todd Smith Grading, Inc.

6/19/2009 $150.001810 Kelly Mill Rd, Cumming, GA 30040
770- 889-7077
770-886-4463

16
Kemi Construction Company, Inc.

6/22/2009 $150.002920 Campbellton Rd SW, Atlanta, GA 30311-4507
404-349-8228
404-349-6113

17
Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

6/22/2009 $150.003000 Smith Road, Forston, GA 31808
706-576-5228
706-576-5227

18
Unity Construction Co., Inc.

6/22/2009 $150.003941 Flint Hill Rd, Powder Springs, GA 30127-2834
770-943-9886
770-943-9828

19
Tom Davidson & Sons, Inc.

6/22/2009 $150.0079 School Rd, Hampton, GA 30228
770-227-1335
770-227-6463

20
Matriarch Construction Co. Inc.

6/23/2009 $150.00100 Lloyd Ave Ste C, Tyrone, GA 30290
770-486-6573
770-486-9043

21
Dekalb Pipe Line Company, Inc.

6/23/2009 $150.002101 Plunkett Rd, Conyers, GA 30012
770-929-8811
770-929-1690



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
SR 34 Sewer System Extension – Phase I 

S207-09-81 
 

   BID DATE: July 7, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

BASE BID ALTERNATE BID 
NO. 1  ALTERNATE BID NO. 2 ALTERNATE BID 

NO. 3 

 BIDDER LICENSE 
NUMBER PART 1 

BASE BID 
(Labor & Materials) 

PART 2 
BASE BID 

(Gravity Sewer System) 
(PS A & B) 

TOTAL PART  
1 & 2 BASE BID 

TOTAL PART  
1 & PART 3 

ALTERNATE 
BASE BID 

(Alt Bid Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

LABOR ONLY ON 
SELECTED PIPE 

NO. 2 
PIPE ONLY 

NO. 2a 
PIPE ONLY 

(Alt Bid 2a Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

OWNER 
PURCHASED 

PUMPS 
(PS A & B) 
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        1. 
Midsouth Builders 
7057 Maddox Road 
Lithonia, GA 30058 

No Bid 
Received 

2. 
Strack Inc. 
125 Laser Industrial Ct, 
Fairburn, GA 30213 

300084    $985,690.72 $424,000.00 $1,409,690.72 $985,690.72 $795,564.90 ---- ---- $256,000.000

3. 
Willow Construction, Inc. 
3970 Flint Hill Road 
Powder Springs, GA 30127 

No Bid 
Received   

4. 
John R. Walker, Inc. 
4038-475 Industrial Blvd. 
Macon, GA 31210 

300134   $986,201.03 $455,418.00 $1,441,619.03 $986,201.03 $793,426.95 $197,390.30 $197,390.30 $296,822.00

5. 
Lanier Contracting, Co. 
3690 Lawrenceville-Suwannee Rd 
Suwanee, GA 30024 

300168    $1,337,035.47 $620,429.32 $1,957,464.79 $1,337,035.47 $733,967.26 ---- ---- $461,833.32

6. 
K.M. Davis Contracting, Co. 
3259 Austell Rd SW 
Marietta, GA 30067 

No Bid 
Received    

7. 
Ronny D. Jones Enterprises 
679 Hwy 29 Ste A  
Newnan, GA 30263 

300114    $1,157,912.90 $515,430.00 $1,673,342.90 $278,944.08 $922,824.28 ---- ---- $331,430.00

8. 
Crawford Grading &Pipeline 
P.O. Box 263 
Luthersville, GA 30251 

300426    $1,039,581.10 $421,551.40 $1,461,132.50 $1,025,399.30 $842,538.04 ---- ---- $258,198.14

9. 
Don Hall Construction, Inc. 
670 Hall Road 
Hampton, GA 30228 

300111    $1,049,567.30 $481,200.00 $1,530,767.30 $1,049,567.30 $854,295.80 ---- ---- $323,200.00



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
SR 34 Sewer System Extension – Phase I 

S207-09-81 
 

   BID DATE: July 7, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

BASE BID ALTERNATE BID 
NO. 1  ALTERNATE BID NO. 2 ALTERNATE BID 

NO. 3 

 BIDDER LICENSE 
NUMBER PART 1 

BASE BID 
(Labor & Materials) 

PART 2 
BASE BID 

(Gravity Sewer System) 
(PS A & B) 

TOTAL PART  
1 & 2 BASE BID 

TOTAL PART  
1 & PART 3 

ALTERNATE 
BASE BID 

(Alt Bid Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

LABOR ONLY ON 
SELECTED PIPE 

NO. 2 
PIPE ONLY 

NO. 2a 
PIPE ONLY 

(Alt Bid 2a Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

OWNER 
PURCHASED 

PUMPS 
(PS A & B) 
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10. 
RTD Construction, Inc. 
P.O. Box 996 
Zephyrhills, FL 33539-0996 

No Bid 
Received   

11. 
American Cast Iron Pipe Co 
2916 16th Street N 
Birmingham, AL 35207 

No Bid 
Received   

12. 
T.J. Lyle & Company, Inc. 
1481 Old Alabama Road 
Taylorsville, GA 30178 

Late 
(3:25pm)   

13. 

Tommy L. Griffin Plumbing 
& Heating 
3743 Atlantic Ave 
Macon, GA 31204 

300110    $1,209,676.31 $515,119.62 $1,724,795.93 $1,209,996.20 $1,019,997.34 ---- ---- $356,524.22

14. 
Todd Smith Grading, Inc. 
1810 Kelly Mill Rd 
Cumming, GA 30040 

302009    $850,554.70 $558,000.00 $1,408,554.70 $848,102.21 $698,010.54 ---- ---- $388,000.00

15. 
Kemi Construction Co., Inc. 
2920 Campbellton Rd SW, 
Atlanta, GA 30311-4507 

No Bid 
Received   

16. 

Consolidated Pipe & Supply 
Co., Inc. 
3000 Smith Road 
Forston, GA 31808 

Material 
Only  

$138,692.22 
(NQ –  

No Item # 13 Bid) 
$178,358.58

17. 
Unity Construction Co., Inc. 
3941 Flint Hill Rd 
Powder Springs, GA 30127 

300132    $1,409,560.30 $605,000.00 $2,014,560.30 $1,418,090.70 $1,208,113.55 ---- ---- $421,200.00

18. 

Davidson Hydrant & Utility 
Services, LLC 
79 School Rd 
Hampton, GA 30228 

302001  $926,947.02 $436,000.00 $1,362,947.02 $926,947.02 $762,086.77 $189,642.00 $189,642.00 $276,000.00



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
SR 34 Sewer System Extension – Phase I 

S207-09-81 
 

   BID DATE: July 7, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

BASE BID ALTERNATE BID 
NO. 1  ALTERNATE BID NO. 2 ALTERNATE BID 

NO. 3 

 BIDDER LICENSE 
NUMBER PART 1 

BASE BID 
(Labor & Materials) 

PART 2 
BASE BID 

(Gravity Sewer System) 
(PS A & B) 

TOTAL PART  
1 & 2 BASE BID 

TOTAL PART  
1 & PART 3 

ALTERNATE 
BASE BID 

(Alt Bid Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

LABOR ONLY ON 
SELECTED PIPE 

NO. 2 
PIPE ONLY 

NO. 2a 
PIPE ONLY 

(Alt Bid 2a Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

OWNER 
PURCHASED 

PUMPS 
(PS A & B) 
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19. 
Matriarch Construction Co. 
100 Lloyd Ave, Ste C 
Tyrone, GA 30290 

No Bid 
Received   

20. 
Dekalb Pipe Line Co., Inc. 
2101 Plunkett Rd 
Conyers, GA 30012 

300105    $881,938.10 $440,000.00 $1,321,938.10 $881,938.10 $679,539.45 ---- ---- $290,000.00

21. 
D & H Construction Co. 
1915 James Jackson Pkwy 
Atlanta, GA 30318 

No Bid 
Received   

22. 
Astra Grading & Pipe, LLC 
300 Churchhill Court 
Woodstock, GA 30188 

301801    $1,259,119.80 $594,037.50 $1,853,157.30 $1,259,119.80 $1,082,678.40 ---- ---- $419,298.00

23. 
Oakley & Ayers Contracting 
58 Weldon Road 
Palmetto, GA 30268 

No Bid 
Received   

24. 
Vellano Bros, Inc. 
1301 Cussetta Rd Bldg B 
Columbus, GA 31901 

Material 
Only  $95,521.22 

Addendum # 1 
$41,622.44

Addendum # 1

25. 
HD Supply Waterworks 
624-A Hancock Industrial 
Athens, GA 30605 

Material 
Only  $168,702.58 $168,702.58

26. 
Cedar Farms & Construct. 
2558 Highway 145 
Eastanollee, GA 30538 

No Bid 
Received   

27. 
Turpin Inc. 
5353 North Lake Dr.  
Lake City, GA 30260 

No Bid 
Received   



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
SR 34 Sewer System Extension – Phase I 
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   BID DATE: July 7, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

BASE BID ALTERNATE BID 
NO. 1  ALTERNATE BID NO. 2 ALTERNATE BID 

NO. 3 

 BIDDER LICENSE 
NUMBER PART 1 

BASE BID 
(Labor & Materials) 

PART 2 
BASE BID 

(Gravity Sewer System) 
(PS A & B) 

TOTAL PART  
1 & 2 BASE BID 

TOTAL PART  
1 & PART 3 

ALTERNATE 
BASE BID 

(Alt Bid Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

LABOR ONLY ON 
SELECTED PIPE 

NO. 2 
PIPE ONLY 

NO. 2a 
PIPE ONLY 

(Alt Bid 2a Force Main 
System for Item # 13 – 

C-900) 

OWNER 
PURCHASED 

PUMPS 
(PS A & B) 
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28. 
Steele & Associates, Inc. 
7561-A Industrial Court 
Alpharetta, GA 30004 

No Bid 
Received   

29. 
POPCO, INC. 
1705 Krug Street 
Albany, GA 31705 

301473   $1,086,519.75 $450,800.00 $1,537,319.75 $1,246,144.86 $870,316.22 ---- $159,625.11 $312000.00

30. 
B&B Horizontal of Manatee 
P.O. Box 594 
Parrish, FL 34219 

No Bid 
Received   

31. 
Lantz Construction, LC 
239 Clifton Lane 
Peachtree City, GA 30269 

No Bid 
Received   

32. 
Hayes Pipe Supply, Inc. 
3450 Novis Pointe NW 
Acworth, GA 30101-6640 

Material 
Only  $183,058.43 $183,058.43

33. 
Ferguson Waterworks 
280 First Manassas Mile Rd 
Fayetteville, GA 30215 

Material 
Only  162,794.59 $166,420.01

34. 
Georgia Development 
300 Galleria Pkwy, # 1600 
Atlanta, GA 30339 

301689    $1,070,501.50 $512,368.50 $1,582,870.00 $1,076,099.58 $813,337.64 ---- ---- $303,045.00

     

 
LEGEND:  Highlighted cells indicate item was calculated incorrectly on submitted 
bid.  Correct amounts shown in spreadsheet.  Miscalculation does not affect who is 
the low bidder. 

 

     

 




