
S&P Project #: Owner:
Time: Bid Date:
Deposit: Location:
Estimated Cost:

Deposit
Received

300 Smith Rd, Fortson, GA 3180815
Consolidated Pipe & Supply Company, Inc.

4/22/2009 $100 00

P.O. Box 4 Columbus, GA 31902
706-324-0143
706-324-2797

4
Gordy Construction Company 

4/16/2009 $100.00

11
Mid-South Builders, Inc.

4/21/2009 $100.00P.O. Box 878, Lithonia GA 30058
770-484-9600
770-484-8046

10
Site Engineering, Inc.

4/20/2009 $100.007025 Best Friend Road, Atlanta, GA 30340
770-263-7234
770-263-0892

9
Lantz Construction, LC 

4/16/2009 $100.00239 Clifton Lane, Peachtree City, GA 30269
678-787-1561
770-632-1958

8
Strack, Inc.

4/16/2009 $100.00125 Laser Industrial Ct, Fairburn, GA 30213
770-969-1591
770-964-7889

7
Don Hall Construction, Inc.

4/16/2009670 Hall Rd, Hampton, GA 30228
770-946-4953
770-946-4626

$100.00

6
Ronny D. Jones Enterprises, Inc.

4/16/2009679 Hwy 29S Ste A, Newnan, GA 30263
770-251-2667
770-254-1563

$100.00

5
American Cast Iron Pipe Company 

4/16/20092916-16 Street North, Birmingham, AL 35207
205-325-8022
205-488-7622

$100.00

3
John D. Stephens, Inc.

4/16/2009272 Hurricane Shoals Road, NE, Lawrenceville, GA 30045
770-972-8000
770-979-3748

$100.00

Dekalb Pipe Line Company, Inc.

4/16/20092101 Plunkett Rd, Conyers, GA 30012
770-929-8811 / 770-231-6435 (cell)
770-929-1690

$100.00

Crawford Grading & Pipeline, Inc.

4/16/20091505 Dunlap Road, Luthersville, GA 30251
770-927-0413
770-927-2533

$100.00

1281 Broad Street, Augusta, GA 30339
706-733-9990
706-733-9992

Reed Construction Data
30 Technology Parkway S., Suite 100, Norcross, GA 30092
770-849-6434
770-849-6472

N/A
AGC Builder's Exchange

4/16/20091940 The Exchange, Suite 300, Marietta, Ga 30339
678-298-4128
866-570-8187

$100

N/A
Stevenson & Palmer Engineering, Inc

4/16/2009

770-254-3714

N/A

Set #

770-254-3710 4/16/2009

Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority

Document Record For:

2:00 PM

Date Issued

Poplar Road Wastewater 
Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority
May 5, 2009
230 East Newnan Road

S207-08-68

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

$1,000,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Bid Amount

3

1

2

5

230 East Newnan Road, Newnan, Ga 30263

N/A 4/16/20091750 Enterprise Way Ste 103, Marietta, GA 30067
770-953-2442
770-953-2430

2430 Herodian Way Ste 101, Smyrna, GA 30081
770-952-2481
770-955-1064
Dodge Plan Room

N/A

13
Southern Crescent Site Development

4/21/2009

Dodge Plan Room

4/16/2009

N/A 4/16/2009

1

2

P.O. Box 71067, Newnan, GA 30271
404-925-6223
770-304-2165

$100.00

4
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4/30/2009
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14
T.J Lyle & Co.

4/22/2009 $100.001481 Old Alabama Rd, Taylorsville, GA 30178
770-607-0164
770-607-0593

12
Willow Construction, Inc.

4/21/2009 $100.003970 Flint Hill Road, Powders Springs, GA 30127
770-222-1555
770-222-9139



S&P Project #: Owner:
Time: Bid Date:
Deposit: Location:
Estimated Cost:

Deposit
Received

$100

Set #

Document Record For:

2:00 PM

Date Issued

Poplar Road Wastewater 
Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority
May 5, 2009
230 East Newnan Road

S207-08-68

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

$1,000,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Bid Amount
706-576-5228
706-576-5227

15 4/22/2009 $100.00



S&P Project #: Owner:
Time: Bid Date:
Deposit: Location:
Estimated Cost:

Deposit
Received

$100

Set #

Document Record For:

2:00 PM

Date Issued

Poplar Road Wastewater 
Coweta County Water & Sewerage Authority
May 5, 2009
230 East Newnan Road

S207-08-68

Name / Address / Phone / Fax

$1,000,000.00 Newnan, GA 30263

Bid Amount

(404) 691-8018

7633 Buchhanan Hwy, Dallas, GA 30157

678-363-2955

29
HD Supply Waterworks 

5/1/2009 $100.003710-B Atlanta Industrial Parkway. Atlanta, GA 30331
(404) 691-0373

28
Alpha Boring Co, Inc. 

4/29/2009 $100.00678-363-5959

1551 Fulenwider Road, Gainesville, GA 30507
770-535-2246
770-535-2248

27
Strickland & Sons Pipeline, Inc.

4/29/2009 $100.00

4120 Presidential Parkway, Suite 115, Atlanta, GA 30340
770-455-1822
800-996-0385

26
SOL Construction, LLC

4/29/2009 $100.00

1301 Cussetta Road, Bldg, B, Columbus, GA 31901
706-322-6160
706-322-3484

25
Vellano Bros, Inc.

4/29/2009 $100.00

295 Shelby Lane, Jasper, GA 30143
706-253-1187
706-253-1186

24
Tritt Contracting, Inc.

4/28/2009 $100.00

4742 J.F.K. Parkway, Adairsville, GA 30103
404-925-4068
770-773-9147  (call first)

23
Bryant Pipeline, Inc.

4/28/2009 $100.00

14 East Gordon Road, Newnan, GA 30263
678-423-7770
678-423-7771

22
Southeastern  Site Development

4/27/2009 $100.00

1705 Krug Street, Albany, GA 31705
229-436-1411
229-883-0382

21
POPCO, INC.

4/27/2009 $100.00

3425 Duluth Park Lane, Duluth, GA 30096
770-251-3421
770-253-2496

19
Creek Contracting, LLC 

4/23/2009 $100.00

155 Robinson Drive, Fayetteville, GA 30214
770-461-8603
770- 461-0470

18
Brent Scarbrough & Company, Inc.

4/22/2009 $100.00

7561 Industrial Ct, Alpharetta, GA 30004
770-475-8199
770-475-8167

17
Steele & Associates, Inc.

4/22/2009 $100.00

6575 Hwy. 189 North, Baker Florida 32531
850-537-5000
850-537-4690

16
Morgan Contracting, Inc.

4/22/2009 $100.00

20
Duncan Pipeline, Inc.

4/24/2009 $100.00100 Old Dawson Village Rd. Suite 120, Dawsonville, GA 30534
678-410-7451
706-216-9856



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
POPLAR ROAD WASTEWATER 

S207-08-68 
 

   BID DATE: May 5, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

EAST/WEST AREA HOSPITAL AREA 
 BIDDER LICENSE 

NUMBER BASE BID ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 2 BASE BID BASE BID 
OPTION ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 1 

(OPTION) ALTERNATIVE 2 

  

  1 
Crawford Grading & Pipeline 
1505 Dunlap Road 
Luthersville, GA 30251 

UC300426 $759,304.56 $573,579.30 NO BID $756,359.54 NO BID $649,300.59 NO BID NO BID 

2 
Dekalb Pipe Line Co, Inc. 
2101 Plunkett Rd. 
Conyers, GA 30012 

UC300105  $617,888.03 $452,652.53 NO BID $771,261.83 751,261.83
Deduct $20,000 $675,634.83 $655,634.83

Deduct $20,000 NO BID 

3 
John D. Stephens, Inc. 
272 Hurricane Shoals Rd, NE  
Lawrenceville, GA 30045 

NO BID   

4 
Gordy Construction Company 
P.O. Box 4  
Columbus, GA 31902 

NO BID   

5 
American Cast Iron Pipe Co. 
2916-16 Street North 
Birmingham, AL 35207 

NO BID   

6 
Ronny D. Jones Enterprises 
679 Hwy 29S Ste A 
Newnan, GA 30263 

UC300114  $716,884.65 $552,142.15 $195,072.00 $916,640.15 $906,640.15
Deduct $10,000 $814,841.15 $804,841.15

Deduct $10,000 $114,396.00

7 
Don Hall Construction, Inc. 
670 Hall Rd 
Hampton, GA 30228 

UC300111  $765,715.90 $566,274.60 NO BID $912,889.95 NO BID $768,282.20 NO BID NO BID 

8 
Strack, Inc. 
125 Laser Industrial Ct 
Fairburn, GA 30213 

UC300084  $689,221.27 $522,791.21 $166,434.67 $761,960.48 $751,960.48
(deduct $10,000) $660,149.76 $650,149.76

(deduct $10,000) $97,763.08

9 
Lantz Construction, LC 
239 Clifton Lane 
Peachtree City, GA 30269 

NO BID   



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
POPLAR ROAD WASTEWATER 

S207-08-68 
 

   BID DATE: May 5, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

EAST/WEST AREA HOSPITAL AREA 
 BIDDER LICENSE 

NUMBER BASE BID ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 2 BASE BID BASE BID 
OPTION ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 1 

(OPTION) ALTERNATIVE 2 

  

  10 
Site Engineering, Inc. 
7025 Best Friend Road 
Atlanta, GA 30340 

UC300075 $1,032,422.00 $837,039.00 NO BID $1,338,427.50 NO BID $1,222,165.50 NO BID NO BID 

11 
Mid-South Builders, Inc. 
P.O. Box 878 
Lithonia GA 30058 

UC300116  $846,318.00 $683,399.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

12 

Willow Construction, Inc. 
3970 Flint Hill Road 
Powders Springs, GA 
30127 

NO BID   

13 

Southern Crescent Site 
Development 
P.O. Box 71067 
Newnan, GA 30271 

UC301671 $550,052.21 $374,537.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

14 
T.J Lyle & Co. 
1481 Old Alabama Rd. 
Taylorsville, GA 30178 

UC301487   $902,097.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

15 
Consolidated Pipe & Supply  
300 Smith Rd 
Fortson, GA 31808 

MATERIAL 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $149,493.55 NO BID       NO BID NO BID NO BID $85,318.05

16 
Morgan Contracting, Inc. 
6575 Hwy. 189 North 
Baker, Florida 32531 

NO BID   

17 
Steele & Associates, Inc. 
7561 Industrial Ct, 
Alpharetta, GA 30004 

NO BID   

18 
Brent Scarbrough & Co, Inc. 
155 Robinson Drive 
Fayetteville, GA 30214 

NO BID   

 



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
POPLAR ROAD WASTEWATER 

S207-08-68 
 

   BID DATE: May 5, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

EAST/WEST AREA HOSPITAL AREA 
 BIDDER LICENSE 

NUMBER BASE BID ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 2 BASE BID BASE BID 
OPTION ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 1 

(OPTION) ALTERNATIVE 2 

  

19 
Creek Contracting, LLC 
3425 Duluth Park Lane 
Duluth, GA 30096 

NO BID   

20 

Duncan Pipeline, Inc. 
100 Old Dawson Village Rd. 
Suite 120 
Dawsonville, GA 30534 

UC300916  $773,353.30 $564,222.40 NO BID $835,296.85 NO BID $673,766.66 NO BID NO BID 

21 
POPCO, INC. 
1705 Krug Street 
Albany, GA 31705 

UC301473    $887,191.90 $697,049.49 $175,068.56 $1,183,101.60 NO BID $1,086,183.98 NO BID $98,661.62

22 
Southeastern Site Dev. 
14 East Gordon Road 
Newnan, GA 30263 

UC301821  $855,828.95 $661,887.45 NO BID $898,212.54 NO BID $785,202.24 NO BID NO BID 

23 
Bryant Pipeline, Inc. 
4742 J.F.K. Parkway 
Adairsville, GA 30103 

NO BID   

24 
Tritt Contracting, Inc. 
295 Shelby Lane 
Jasper, GA 30143 

NO BID   

25 

Vellano Bros, Inc. 
1301 Cussetta Road 
Bldg. B 
Columbus, GA 31901 

MATERIAL 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $160,465.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92,083.32

26 

SOL Construction, LLC 
4120 Presidential Parkway 
Suite 115 
Atlanta, GA 30340 

NO BID   

27 
Strickland & Sons Pipeline 
1551 Fulenwider Road 
Gainesville, GA 30507 

NO BID   



COWETA COUNTY WATER & SEWERAGE AUTHORITY  
POPLAR ROAD WASTEWATER 

S207-08-68 
 

   BID DATE: May 5, 2009 
 TIME DUE: 2:00 P.M. 
BIDS RECEIVED : 
 

EAST/WEST AREA HOSPITAL AREA 
 BIDDER LICENSE 

NUMBER BASE BID ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 2 BASE BID BASE BID 
OPTION ALTERNATIVE 1 ALTERNATIVE 1 

(OPTION) ALTERNATIVE 2 

  

28 
Alpha Boring Co, Inc.  
7633 Buchhanan Hwy 
Dallas, GA 30157 

NO BID   

29 
HD Supply Waterworks 
3710-B Atlanta Ind. Pkwy 
Atlanta, GA 30331 

DO NOT 
OPEN 

PACKAGE NOT 
MARKED  

NO MATERIAL/ 
NO UC # 

 

30 
Main Line Supply Company 
1045 Post Way 
Jonesboro, GA 30238 

MATERIAL 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $158,487.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90,639.21

31 
Ferguson Waterworks 
280 First Manassas Mile Rd 
Fayetteville, GA 30215 

MATERIAL 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $159,760.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92,446.40

   

 

LEGEND:  Highlighted cells indicate item was calculated 
incorrectly on submitted bid.  Correct amounts shown in 
spreadsheet.  Miscalculation does not affect who is the low 
bidder. 

 

 


